
























Taungya is a more 
systematic, organized, and 
environmentally sound 
alternative to the traditional 
practice of shifting cultivation 
that has been followed for 
generations. Its design shares
similarities with the shifting 
cultivation system in several 
aspects.

Now start writing its 
properties comparing with 
Shifting cultivation







sustainable livelihood means a
more diverse production 
system with ensures long-term
well-being and economic 
stability for individuals and 
communities. This approach 
involves incorporating various 
income-generating 
endeavours, such as 
agriculture, livestock rearing, 
cottage industries, and other 
forms of enterprise, to create a
resilient and balanced 
economic foundation.

Here Social Forestry -


































































